
547 Antrim Road Newtownabbey, Newtownabbey, BT36 4RF
028 9034 2772

We are proud to display this Brand New Nissan ARIYA 87kW
Evolve (22kW Charger) with the upgraded Nappa Leather
Interior, finished in the rich Gun Metal Grey. A stunning vehicle
throughout, , with heated and ventilated seats, around view
cameras, sat nav, heads up drivers display, intelligent rear view
mirror and much, much more. The 87kW battery can provide up
to 329 miles per charge, with the 22kW on board charging letting
you charge up even quicker. Book your test drive or call into our
showroom at Charles Hurst Nissan Newtownabbey to view the
car. Brand New Nissan ARIYA 87kW (22kW Charger)

Vehicle Features

3 rear head restraints, 3x3 point rear seat belts, 6m EVSE 3-pin
cable, 8 way electric adjust front seats with memory, 12.3" Full
TFT screen, 12.3" navigation system, 12v socket in front, 60/40
split folding rear seat, 360 camera, 360 degree digitally
enhanced around view monitor, Adaptive high beam assist,
Adjustable speed limiter, Advanced sequential turning lights,
Advanced windscreen head up display, Advance intelligent key
with driver memory storage (seats, Air Conditioning, Alarm, Alloy
Wheels, audio), Auto hold function, Auto lights, Automatic dual
zone climate control, Automatic LED headlights, Auto parking
system, Blind spot intervention, Bluetooth audio streaming with
handsfree system, Bluetooth Connection, Bluetooth Music
Streaming, Climate Control, Compatible With Apple Carplay or
Android Auto, Curtain and front side, cyclist recognition and
junction assist, DAB audio, Door mirror memory, Drive modes
select (Eco, Driver's electric lumbar adjustment, Driver and
passenger airbags, Electrically adjustable steering column with

Nissan ARIYA 178Kw Evolve 87Kwh 22Kwch 5Dr
Auto [Leather] | NEW
BRAND NEW - UP TO 329 MILES

Fuel Type: Electric
Transmission: Automatic
Colour: Grey
Body Style: Hatchback

DIMENSIONS

Length: 4595mm
Width: 1850mm
Height: 1660mm
Seats: 5
Luggage Capacity (Seats
Up):

408L

 

PERFORMANCE &
ECONOMY

Fuel Consum. (Urban
Cold):
Not AvailableMPG
Fuel Consum. (Extra
Urban):
Not AvailableMPG
Fuel Consum.
(Combined):
Not AvailableMPG
Number Of Gears: 1 SPEED
Top Speed: 100MPH
Acceleration 0-100 km/h: 7.6s
Engine Power BHP: 238.7BHP
 

£53,999 
 

Technical Specs
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memory, Electrically driven intelligent braking system, Electric
panoramic sunroof, Electronic parking brake, far side airbags,
Follow me home headlights, Front & Rear Parking Sensors, Front
and rear parking sensors, Front and rear USB connections (Type-
A and Type-C), Front head restraints, Front ventilated brake
discs, Hands free power tailgate, Heads-Up display, Heated and
auto folding door mirrors, Heated front seats, Heated front
windscreen, Heated rear seats, Heated Seats, Heated steering
wheel, Heat pump, Intelligent Cruise control (ICC), Intelligent
driver alert system, Intelligent front emergency braking with
pedestrian, Intelligent key and start push button with easy
access, Intelligent Rear View Mirror, Intelligent speed limit assist,
Intelligent traffic jam pilot and lane keep assist, iPod Connection,
Keyless Start, Lane departure prevention, Leather Interior, LED
ambient lighting, LED daytime running lights, LED front and rear
fog lights, LED rear lights, Luggage board system, mirrors,
Moving object detection, Nappa leather upholstery, Navi-Link,
normal and sport), One touch front and rear electric windows
with remote opening and closing, Panoramic sunroof, Parking
Sensors, PAS, Plasma cluster ion air purifier, Power magic centre
storage with table, Power Operated Tailgate, Power sliding
centre console, Power tailgate, Premium Delivery Pack, ProPilot,
Rain sensing wipers, Rear air vents, Rear armrest, Rear cross
traffic alert, Rear privacy glass, Rear ventilated brake discs, Rear
wiper, Reverse tilting door mirrors, Satellite Navigation, Satin
chrome window surround, Seat back pockets, Shark fin antenna,
Side airbags, Sunroof, Super smooth leather steering wheel,
Super UV and infrared cut glass, Telematics - notifications and
connectivity services, Tinted Glass, Traffic sign recognition, Type
2 mode 3 charging cable, USB Connection, Ventilated front
seats, Ventilated seats, Virtual personal assistant and firmware
over the air capability, Wireless Apple CarPlay and wired Android
Auto, Wireless phone charger
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