
Unit 1 Drumharvey Industrial Estate Dromore Road Irvinestown, Irvinestown, BT94 1ET
Office: 02868621905 | Aaron: 07999764219 | Paul: 07886 031279

All our cars are prepared and presented to the highest possible
standards. Vehicles are all serviced and professionally valeted
prior to sale and with a comprehensive warranty. Part exchange
very welcome and finance also available. Please call us today for
a tailor made quotation. PLEASE NOTE - To avoid any
disappointment please call prior to arrival to ensure the vehicle
you are interested in has not been reserved by another customer
and is on site available for viewing. ABOUT US - We are a family
owned business with up to 100 quality used vehicles in stock.
With extensive images and descriptions, walk around videos,
bespoke finance quotation tools and the ability to reserve
vehicles too, head over to fermanaghautosales.co.uk and get in
touch with our team today!

Vehicle Features

2 USB sockets in rear, 3x3 point rear seatbelts, 8 Speakers,
12.3" digital instrument cluster display, 12.3in Digital Instrument
Cluster, 12in HD Touchscreen, 12V Socket, 19in Alloy Wheels -
Beijing - Diamond-Cut, 40-60 Split Rear Seats Backrest, ABS,
Acoustic, Acoustic - Tinted and Heated Windscreens, Active city
braking, Advanced technology pack - DS 7, Airbags - Curtain
Rear, Alarm - Perimetric and Volumetric, Alcantara dashboard
and door panels with stitching, Aluminium footrest, Aluminium
sports pedals, Anti-lock Braking System - Anti-lock Braking
System, apple carplay and andriod auto, Auto Comfort Pack,
Automatic Bi-Zone Automatic Air Conditioning, Automatic front
doors and boot locking, Automatic Front Doors and Boot Locking
While Driving, Automatic headlights, Automatic lighting at car
unlocking, Autonomous Emergency Braking, Bluetooth hands

DS 7 Crossback 2.0 BlueHDi Performance Line
5dr EAT8 | Dec 2019

Miles: 83000
Fuel Type: DIESEL
Transmission: Automatic
Colour: Grey
Engine Size: 1997
CO2 Emission: 128
Body Style: Sport utility vehicle
Insurance group: 29E
Reg: CA69WBJ

DIMENSIONS

Length: 4573mm
Width: 1895mm
Height: 1620mm
Seats: 5
Luggage Capacity (Seats
Up):

555L

Gross Weight: 2135KG
Max. Loading Weight: 600KG
 

PERFORMANCE &
ECONOMY

Fuel Consum. (Urban
Cold):

50.4MPG

Fuel Consum. (Extra
Urban):

64.2MPG

Fuel Consum.
(Combined):

57.6MPG

Fuel Tank Capacity: 55L
Number Of Gears: 8 SPEED
Top Speed: 134MPH
Acceleration 0-100 km/h: 9.4s
Engine Power BHP: 177BHP

£14,990 
 

Technical Specs
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free and media streaming with USB socket, Bluetooth Handsfree
and Media Streaming with USB Socket, Body colour door
handles, Body coloured bumpers, Carmine Centre Caps, Carmine
centre caps with DS logo, Chrome controls, Chrome Entry Sill,
Cloth sunvisors with LED courtesy mirror and ticket holder,
Comfort Seats Pack, Comfort seats pack - DS 7 Performance
Line, Cruise Control with Speed Limiter, DAB Digital radio, Dark
tinted rear windows, Defrosting door mirrors, Door Mirrors -
Electrically Folding and Heated with DS LED Spotlight, Driver,
Driver-Front Passenger-Front Lateral and Curtain Airbags, Driver
attention warning, DS 3D LED rear lights, DS active LED Vision
headlights, DS Active scan suspension, DS Connect Box
emergency and assistance system, DS Connect Nav System, DS
Inspiration - Performance Line, DS inspiration badge on front
doors, DS Monogram on the Rear Tailgate, DS Performance Line
badge on bonnet, DS Performance Line Badge on the Bonnet, DS
performance line monogram on the rear tailgate, DS Sensorial
Drive, DS sensorial drive in Cashmere/ Titanium modes, Electric
lumbar adjustment, Electric parking brake, Electric power
steering, Emergency braking system, ESP, ESP - Electronic
Stability Programme, Flocked glasses storage on driver side,
Follow me home manual lighting, Frameless electrochrome
interior rear view mirror, Frameless Electrochromic Interior Rear
View Mirror, Front and rear door pockets, Front and Rear Door
Storage, Front Armrest with Storage, Front central armrest with
storage, Front Closed Storage, Front closed storage with USB
connection point, Front door entry sill with DS Performance Line
design, Front Double Cup Holder, Front double cupholders, Front
Electric Windows, Front head restraints, front lateral and curtain
airbags, front passenger, Front seatback pockets, Front Seats
with Rear Pocket, Full LED standard interior lighting, Gear shift
indicator, Gloss Black Door Mirrors, Gloss black exterior door
mirrors, Gloss Black Front Grille, Headlights - Automatic, Height
Adjustable Front Seat Belts with Pre-Tensioners and Front and
Rear Load Limiter, Height adjustable front seatbelts with
pretensioners and front and rear load limiter, Height and depth
adjustable steering wheel, High beam assist, Hill start assist,
Immobiliser, Inox Roof Rails, Inox windows surrounding, Keyless
Start, Lane Departure Warning, Lane departure warning system,
LED daytime running lights, LED Front Fog Lights with Cornering
Light Function, LED front fog lights with static cornering light
function, Manual Follow Me Home Lighting, Mirror Screen with
Android Auto and Apple Car Play, Mirror screen with mirror link,
Multi-Function On-Board Trip Computer, Multi function on board
trip computer, Open storage on driver side, Perforated leather
steering wheel with contrast stitching, Performance line badged
front/rear carpet mats, PERFORMANCE Line Badged Front and
Rear Carpet Mats, Performance Line monogram on the
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dashboard, Perimetric and volumetric anti theft alarm, Premium
leather gear knob, Rear Armrest with Storage, Rear central
armrest with storage, Rear Double Cup Holder, Rear double
cupholders, Rear headrests, Rear parking sensor, Rear Parking
Sensors, Remote central locking + deadlocks, Remote Control
Central Locking with Deadlocks, Safety kit including first aid kit,
Seats - Front Electric Lumbar Adjustment, Service indicator, Ski
Flap, Space saver spare wheel, Speed limit recognition and
speed warning, Speed Limit Recognition Warning, Stop/ Start
function, Textured black DS wings, Textured black rear bumper,
tinted and heated windscreen, TomTom Speedcam - Danger
Zones - 3 Year Subscription, Trailer stability control, Two position
floor, Two rear isofix mounting points, Two Rear USB Sockets,
Tyre Pressure Monitor, Tyre pressure monitoring system, Voice
Recognition, yellow vest and Warning triangle
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